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Behavioural Economics and Policy Design: Examples From Singapore is a
must-read for anyone interested in using behavioural economics to design
effective policies. The book provides a comprehensive overview of the field,
with examples from Singapore that illustrate how behavioural economics
can be used to improve policy outcomes.

The book is divided into three parts. The first part provides an overview of
behavioural economics, including its key concepts and principles. The
second part discusses how behavioural economics can be used to design
effective policies in a variety of areas, such as health, education, and
finance. The third part presents a series of case studies that illustrate how
behavioural economics has been used to improve policy outcomes in
Singapore.
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The book is written in a clear and concise style, and it is packed with
practical examples. It is a valuable resource for policymakers, researchers,
and anyone else who is interested in using behavioural economics to
improve the world.

Key Features

Provides a comprehensive overview of behavioural economics

Includes examples from Singapore that illustrate how behavioural
economics can be used to improve policy outcomes

Written in a clear and concise style

Packed with practical examples

A valuable resource for policymakers, researchers, and anyone else
who is interested in using behavioural economics to improve the world
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"Behavioural Economics and Policy Design: Examples From Singapore is a
timely and important book. It provides a clear and concise overview of the
field, and it is packed with practical examples. This book is a valuable



resource for policymakers, researchers, and anyone else who is interested
in using behavioural economics to improve the world." - [Reviewer's
Name]

"This book is a must-read for anyone interested in using behavioural
economics to design effective policies. The authors provide a
comprehensive overview of the field, and they illustrate how behavioural
economics can be used to improve policy outcomes in a variety of areas.
This book is a valuable resource for policymakers, researchers, and
anyone else who is interested in using behavioural economics to make the
world a better place." - [Reviewer's Name]
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In a world awash with information, it has become increasingly difficult to
separate truth from fiction. Media bias and political propaganda are
pervasive, threatening the...

Achieve Focus, Presence, and Enlightened
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In today's fast-paced, demanding world, leaders are constantly faced with
overwhelming responsibilities, distractions, and stress. To navigate...
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