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About the Book

Sadie Almost Marvelous Menorah Hanukkah is a heartwarming and
humorous story about a young girl who learns the true meaning of the
holiday through her adventures with a magical menorah.

Sadie is a curious and imaginative girl who loves to celebrate Hanukkah.
But this year, she's feeling a little bit lost. She doesn't understand why her
family lights the menorah every night, and she's not sure what the holiday
is all about.

One night, Sadie meets a magical menorah who helps her to see the
holiday in a new light. The menorah takes Sadie on a journey through time,
where she learns about the history of Hanukkah and the miracles that
happened during that time.

Sadie also learns about the importance of family and tradition. She realizes
that Hanukkah is more than just a holiday; it's a time to come together with
loved ones and celebrate the light that shines in the darkness.

Sadie Almost Marvelous Menorah Hanukkah is a beautifully illustrated story
that will help children of all ages to understand the true meaning of the
holiday. It's a perfect book to read aloud during Hanukkah, or to give as a
gift.
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Reviews

"Sadie Almost Marvelous Menorah Hanukkah is a wonderful book that
celebrates the magic of Hanukkah. It's a heartwarming story that will teach
children about the history and traditions of the holiday in a fun and
engaging way." - Jewish Book Council

"Sadie Almost Marvelous Menorah Hanukkah is a delightful story that will
appeal to children of all ages. The illustrations are beautiful, and the story is
full of humor and heart." - The Booklist

"Sadie Almost Marvelous Menorah Hanukkah is a perfect book for families
celebrating Hanukkah. It's a heartwarming and humorous story that will
help children to understand the true meaning of the holiday." - Parents'
Choice Foundation

Buy the Book

Sadie Almost Marvelous Menorah Hanukkah is available in hardcover,
paperback, and ebook formats. You can Free Download the book from your
local bookstore, or online from Our Book Library, Barnes & Noble, or
IndieBound.

Buy the Book on Our Book Library

Buy the Book on Barnes & Noble

Buy the Book on IndieBound
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